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FOREWORD

The interface between the mental health and criminal justice systems

must be seen within the historical context of mental health law.

Persons with mental illness have always been plagued by myths

surrounding their illness, and have suffered from prejudice and stigma.

Within this context, two sets of laws formulated during the ninetecnth
century became legion in that they were the first to establish policies
for treating the mentally ill: the so called " Regimen for the Alienated"
was adopted by French law in 1838, and later the English introduced

"The Lunatic Act of 1890." Although enacted by two different judicial
systems, these laws had the same objective: to regulate internment of
the mentally ill with a view toward protecting society, while simul-
taneously favoring treatment and curtailing abuses concerning
individualliberty. Compared to the arbitrary treatment ofthe mentally
ill in preceding centuries, legislation in the nineteenth century pro-
vided significant gains. More recently, the principle of adequate
treatment in mental hospitals has been confirmed as the legal right of
the involuntarily confined mental patient. The direct order issued

under Wyatt +. Stickney (1972) regarding minimal standards of
adequate treatment was crucial in that it was the most noteworthy

attempt to date to guarantee the individual rights of persons treated

within mental health and mental retardation facilities.
The linkagebetween the mental health and criminal justicesystems

is a far from recent phenomenon. The insanity defense is deeply
Tooled in Anglo-American legal tradition and dates back over 800
years. It is based on the concept known as mens rea; i.e., a person
must havea "criminal mind" at the time that an offense was committed
in order to be guilty of a crime. The so-called MºNaghten rule, estat
lished in the trial of Daniel M'Naghten, confirmed that a person
suffering from a mental illness could be found not guilty by reason of
insanity. This was confirmed in the trial of Monte Durham in 1954,
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